
Unveiling the Hidden Secrets of Numbers in
Scripture: A Journey with E.W. Bullinger
Embark on an extraordinary journey into the enigmatic realm of numbers in
Scripture, where each digit and sequence holds profound significance.
Guided by the renowned biblical scholar E.W. Bullinger, you will delve into
the hidden meanings that have eluded many for centuries.
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Numbers: The Language of God

Throughout the Bible, numbers are not mere placeholders but integral parts
of God's divine communication. Bullinger believed that God, being a
meticulous and purposeful creator, employed numbers as a language to
convey His truths and principles.

In his seminal work, "Number in Scripture," Bullinger meticulously
examines the numerical patterns and symbolism woven throughout the
Bible, providing a comprehensive guide to their interpretation. From the
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Creation account to the Book of Revelation, numbers serve as a window
into the mind and heart of God.

The Sevenfold Pattern

One of the most prevalent numerical patterns in Scripture is the sevenfold
pattern. This divine number represents completeness, perfection, and
divine Free Download. It is found in countless biblical narratives, from the
seven days of Creation to the seven churches of Revelation.

Bullinger demonstrates how the sevenfold pattern permeates Old and New
Testament stories, reinforcing the concept of God's sovereignty and the
cyclical nature of history. Understanding this pattern enriches our
comprehension of God's plan and purpose.

The Significance of Three and Four

Beyond the ubiquitous sevenfold pattern, Bullinger also sheds light on the
significance of other key numbers in Scripture. Three, representing the
Trinity, and four, signifying the material world, are frequently employed to
convey profound biblical truths.

For instance, the three patriarchs (Abraham, Isaac, and Jacob) foreshadow
the Trinity, while the four gospels (Matthew, Mark, Luke, and John) present
the life of Christ from different perspectives.

Numerical Symbolism in Prophecy

Bullinger's work is not limited to historical and narrative contexts. He also
explores the profound role of numbers in prophecy. The enigmatic
prophecies of Daniel, Ezekiel, and Revelation abound with numerical
symbolism, each number carrying a specific meaning.



By understanding the numerical patterns in these prophetic passages, we
can gain insight into future events and God's plan for the end times.
Bullinger's analysis provides a valuable key to unlocking the mysteries of
prophecy.

The Practical Application

The study of numbers in Scripture is not merely an academic pursuit but
has practical implications for our Christian walk. By understanding the
hidden meanings behind numbers, we can deepen our understanding of
God's Word and apply its truths to our own lives.

Numerical patterns can reinforce biblical principles, provide guidance in
decision-making, and offer encouragement in times of difficulty. Bullinger's
work empowers us to use numbers as a tool for spiritual growth and
discernment.

E.W. Bullinger's "Number in Scripture" is a timeless masterpiece that has
revolutionized our understanding of the Bible. By unveiling the hidden
secrets of numbers, Bullinger invites us on a transformative journey,
unlocking the depths of God's Word and enriching our faith.

Whether you are a seasoned Bible scholar or a curious seeker of biblical
truth, this book will ignite your passion for Scripture and deepen your
appreciation for the intricate tapestry of God's divine revelation.
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Step into the heart-stopping world of Jack Reacher, the legendary nomad
with a keen eye for justice and a relentless pursuit of the truth. In Lee
Child's gripping novel,...
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